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In ToTo 

1 July – 15 July 2017 

 

Decoding session:  

1 July 2017 | 6 – 8 pm 

Artists Present:  

Gedvile Bunykite Grace (Lithuania) 

Venue: Sin Sin Atelier 

G/F, 52 Sai Street, Central, HK 

 

 
Sin Sin Fine Art is pleased to present a solo exhibition of Lithuanian artist 
Gedvile Bunykite Grace “In ToTo” from 1 July until 15 July 2017. The 
Lithuanian Artist Gedvile Grace Bunykite will decode the logos, nature 
and existence behind her art to inaugurate her 1st solo exhibition "In 
ToTo" at Sin Sin Atelier in Wong Chuk Hang on 1 July 2017, 6pm-7:30pm. 
 
Gedvile, also known by her artist name Grace B, is one of those thirsty 
for knowledge and cognition, who devoted her life to crack the code 
of logos, nature and being. She builds her knowledge in philosophy, 
physics, psychology, spirituality, and mysticism. The way she expresses 
her reasoning is wordless, symbolic and abstract, as she has created 
her own language in drawings – language which is similar to that of 
Aristotle’s only because it is presented on a piece of paper by using 
writing utensils. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
  	
   	
  
 
 
 
About Sin Sin Fine Art: 
 
Sin Sin Fine Art is the first and main force in Hong Kong to bring 
Indonesian artworks to Hong Kong and open new windows for them to 
the international art scene. Sin Sin Fine Art focuses on contemporary art 
from all over the world that is spiritual and inspiring, cultivating a 
collection of works by selected international artists. Ms Sin Sin Man 
considers herself a risk taker, in the sense that her choices of artists are 
based not on their market value but on a genuine appreciation of their 
vision and talent - no matter where they come from. This sincere 
approach proved to be fruitful with many of the artists she has shown 
and who later received recognition on an international level. 
 

 
 
 

For more information or to arrange interview, 
Feel free to contact 

Heather Kong 
at heather@sinsinfineart.com 

Thank you. 


